City of Barberton

WWTP Improvements - 2009 Rehabilitation

Bid Opening: October 22, 2009

TABULATION OF BIDS

07348

BASE BID ALTERNATE BASEBID &
CONTRACT CONTRACTOR AMOUNT ALTERNATE
SEPARATE CONTRACT BIDS
A General Kenmore Construction 3,536,000.00 170,817.00 3,706,817.00
B Electrical Enertech Electrical 1,269,200.00 N.A.
C HVAC No Bid No Bid
D Plumbing No Bid No Bid
C&D HVAC/Plumbin Meccon 100,000.00 N.A.
4,905,200.00 5,076,017.00
COMBINED CONTRACT BID
A, B,C,&D North Bay Construction 4,748,388.00 212,273.00 4,960,661.00



WWTP Improvements - 2009 Rehabilitation
City of Barberton
Bid Opening Date: October 22, 2009
Bid Tabulation Summary
Contract A - General Construction - Base
Project No. 07348

LIST OF BIDDERS
BIDDER
1 Kenmore Construction Co., Inc.
700 Home Ave.
Akron, OH 44310

Phone number: (330) 762-9373

2 Workman Industrial Services, Inc.
310 Tallmadge Rd.

Kent, OH 44240
Phone number: (330) 678-7002

3 Bogner Construction Company
305 West Mulberry Street
887

Wooster, OH 446917887
Phone number: (330) 262-6730

4 Shook, Inc. - Northern Division
10245 Brecksville Rd.

Brecksville, OH 441410020
Phone number: (440) 838-5400
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WWTP Improvements - 2009 Rehabilitation
City of Barberton
Bid Opening Date: October 22, 2009
Bid Tabulation Summary
Contract A - General Construction - Base
Project No. 07348

LIST OF TOTALS
NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

Bidder's
Name Calculated Total Informal Totals
1.  Kenmore Construction Co., Inc. $3.536,000.00
2. Workman Industrial Services, Inc. $3,575.414.00
3.  Bogner Construction Company $3,729,325.00
4.  Shook, Inc. - Northern Division $3.810,400.00
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WWTP Improvements - 2009 Rehabilitation
City of Barberton
Bid Opening Date: October 22, 2009
Bid Tabulation Summary
Contract A - General Construction - Alternates
Project No. 07348

LIST OF TOTALS
NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

Bidder's
Name Calculated Total Informal Totals
1.  Workman Industrial Services, Inc. $137,597.00
2. Kenmore Construction Co., Inc. $170,817.00
3. Bogner Construction Company $195.000.00
4.  Shook, Inc. - Northern Division $197,290.00
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WWTP Improvements - 2009 Rehabilitation
City of Barberton
Bid Opening Date: October 22, 2009
Bid Tabulation Summary
Contract B - Electrical
Project No. 07348

LIST OF BIDDERS
BIDDER

1 Enertech Electrical, Inc
101 Youngstown Lowellville Rd.
PO Box 144

Lowellville, OH 44436
Phone number: (330) 536-2131

2 Summit Electric Co.
895-E Hampshire Rd.

Stow, OH 44224
Phone number: (330) 920-1777

3 Penn-Ohio Electrical Co.
1370 Sharon Hogue Rd., NE

Masury, OH 44438
Phone number: (330) 448-4066

4 Thompson Electric Inc.
49 Northmoreland Ave.

Munroe Falls, OH 44262
Phone number: (330) 686-2300

5 Dickey Electric, Inc.
180 W. South Range Rd.
PO Box 186

North Lima, OH 44452-0186
Phone number: (330) 549-3976

October 23, 2009 Page 1



WWTP Improvements - 2009 Rehabilitation
City of Barberton
Bid Opening Date: October 22, 2009
Bid Tabulation Summary
Contract B - Electrical
Project No. 07348

LIST OF TOTALS
NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

Bidder's
Name Calculated Total Informal Totals
1.  Enertech Electrical, Inc $1.269,200.00
2. Summit Electric Co. $1.340,700.00
3.  Penn-Ohio Electrical Co. $1.369,000.00
4. Thompson Electric Inc. $1,370,000.00
5. Dickey Electric, Inc. $1.396,000.00
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WWTP Improvements - 2009 Rehabilitation
City of Barberton
Bid Opening Date: October 22, 2009
Bid Tabulation Summary
Combined Contracts C & D - HVAC/Plumbing
Project No. 07348

LIST OF BIDDERS
BIDDER

1 Meccon, Inc.
529 Grant Street, Suite #100

Akron, OH 44331
Phone number: (330) 253-6188
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WWTP Improvements - 2009 Rehabilitation
City of Barberton
Bid Opening Date: October 22, 2009
Bid Tabulation Summary
Combined Contracts C & D - HVAC/Plumbing
Project No. 07348

LIST OF TOTALS
NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.
Bidder's
Name Calculated Total Informal Totals

1. Meccon, Inc. $100,000.00

October 23, 2009 Page 1
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WWTP Improvements - 2009 Rehabilitation
City of Barberton
Bid Opening Date: October 22, 2009
Bid Tabulation Summary
Combined Contracts A - D - General/Electrical/HVAC/Plumbing - Base
Project No. 07348

LIST OF BIDDERS
BIDDER
1 North Bay Construction Inc.
25800 First St.
Westlake, OH 44145

Phone number: (440) 835-1898

2 Kenmore Construction Co., Inc.
700 Home Ave.
Akron, OH 44310
Phone number: (330) 762-9373

3 Workman Industrial Services, Inc.
310 Tallmadge Rd.

Kent, OH 44240
Phone number: (330) 678-7002
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WWTP Improvements - 2009 Rehabilitation
City of Barberton
Bid Opening Date: October 22, 2009
Bid Tabulation Summary
Combined Contracts A - D - General/Electrical/ HVAC/Plumbing - Base
Project No. 07348

LIST OF TOTALS
NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

Bidder's

Name Calculated Total Informal Totals
1. North Bay Construction Inc. $4.748.,388.00 $4.765.443.00
2.  Kenmore Construction Co.. Inc. $5.012,700.00
3.  Workman Industrial Services, Inc. $5.160,944.00

October 23, 2009 Page 1
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WWTP Improvements - 2009 Rehabilitation
City of Barberton
Bid Opening Date: October 22, 2009
Bid Tabulation Summary
Combined Contracts A - D - General/Electrical/HV AC/Plumbing - Alternates
Project No. 07348

LIST OF TOTALS
NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

Bidder's
Name Calculated Total Informal Totals
1. Workman Industrial Services, Inc. $137,597.00
2.  Kenmore Construction Co., Inc. $170,817.00
3. North Bay Construction Inc. $212,273.00

October 23, 2009 Page 1
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