CONNEAUT PORT AUTHORITY
FLOATING DOCK SYSTEM AT LAGOON DOCKS - 0651901
BID DATE: 4/20/07

BID SUMMARY
CONTRACT A: FURNISH & CONTRACT B: FURNISH,
DELIVERY ONLY DELIVER & INSTALL
A-1 A-2 B-1 B-2
Deliver by Deliver by Deliver & Install  Deliver & Install
Bidder 10/31/07 7/27/07 by 10/31/07 by 7/27/07
Kropf Industrial $144,980 00 -$149,870.00 $158,500.00 $164,900.00

Merco, Inc. $119,369 11 $119,369.11 No Bid No Bid




CONNEAUT PORT AUTHCRITY
FLOATING DOCK SYSTEM AT LAGOON DOCKS - 0651901
BID DATE: 4/20/07
BID TABULATION

Kropf Industrial
Unit of Unit Price Unit Price
Description Quan. Measure Labor Material ltem Total

CONTRACT A-1: FURNISH AND DELIVERY ONLY - OCTOBER 31, 2007 MAXIMUM DELIVERY DATE

Furnish & Deliver Complete Dock System 1 LUMP $60,892.00 384,088 00 $144,980.00

CONTRACT A-2: FURNISH AND DELIVERY ONLY - JULY 27, 2007 MAXIMUM DELIVERY DATE

Furnish & Deliver Complete Dock System 1 LUMP $65,782 00 $84,083.00 $149,87000

CONTRACT B-1: FURNISH, DELIVERY, AND INSTALLATION - OCTOBER 31, 2007 MAXIMUM DELIVERY DATE

Furnish, Deliver, and Install Complete Dock System 1 LUMP $74,412.00 $84,088.00 $158,500.00

CONTRACT B-2: FURNISH, DELIVERY, AND INSTALLATION - JULY 27, 2007 MAXIMUM DELIVERY DATE

Furnish, Deliver, and Install Complete Dock System 1 LUMP $80,812.00 $84,088.00 $164,900.00

Merco, Inc.
Unit Price
Material Item Total

$119,369.11 $119,369 11

$119,369.11 $119,369.11

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid




