EUCLID MEMORIAL PARK - PRESS BOX / CONCESS
CITY OF EUCLID

PROJECT NO. 11167
BID OPENING DATE: JULY 11, 2011

ION BUILDING

BID TABULATION
CONTRACT A A1 A2 A3 A4 CONTRACTA | CONTRACTB M1 CONTRACT B | CONTRACT C E1 CONTRACTC | CONTRACTD | CONTRACTD
COMPANY NAME General Trades |Observatory| Metal Stud | Bieachers | Building | General Trades Mechanical PTAC-1 Mechanical Electrical Public Electrical Combined Combined Base

Base Bid Deck Walls Concrete | Concrete | BaseBid & Alts. |  Base Bid Base Bid & Alt. | Base Bid Address. | Base Bid & Alt. Base Bid Bid and Alts.
A.J. Goulder Electric, Inc. NO BID NOBID | NOBD | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $27,825.00 | $6,780.00 | $34,605.00 NO BID NO BID
Bennett Construction Mgmt.| $254,800.00 |$14,000.00 | ($3,500.00) | $4,200.00 | $4,300.00 | $273.800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
The John F. Gallagher Co. NO BID 'NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID $59,240.00 | $2.200.00 | $61,440.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
VIP Restoration Inc. $245,000.00 |$25,200.00 | $8,000.00 | $3,500.00 | $3,600.00 | $285,300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




