PROJECT: Baldwin Road Widening & Resurfacing Impr.
OWNER: Village of Kirtland Hills

PROJECT NO.: 10376
SORTED BY BASE BID

BIDDER BASE BASE & BASE &

BID ALTA ALTB
Mr. Excavator, Inc. 486,284.02 807,434.02 812,880.62
Eclipse Co. 491,641.65 834,682.02  844,155.04
Karvo Paving Co. 497,445.75 808,203.75  856,696.50
Hallmark Excavating 509,932.45 866,240.45  877,738.45

C.LR,, Inc. 522,325.83 No Bid No Bid

ALTERNATES ALT A ALTB

Asphalt

Asphalt Paving Paving
Completion Completion

10/19/12 6/15/13
Mr. Excavator, Inc. 321,150.00  326,596.60
Eclipse Co. 343,040.37  352,513.39
Karvo Paving Co. 310,758.00  359,250.75
Hallmark Excavating 356,308.00  367,806.00

C.LR., Inc. . No Bid No Bid



Baldwin Road Street and Culvert Replacement
Village of Kirtland Hills
Bid Opening Date: May 17, 2012
Bid Tabulation Summary
Base Bid
Project No. 10376

LIST OF BIDDERS
BIDDER

1 Mr. Excavator, Inc.
8616 Euclid Chardon Rd.
Kirtland, OH 44094
Phone number: (440) 256-2008

2 Eclipse Co., LL.C.
23209 Miles Rd. #120 B

Warrensville Hts., OH 44128
Phone number: (216) 332-9821

3 Karvo Paving Co.
4524 Hudson Drive

Stow, OH 44224
Phone number: (330) 929-9616

4 Hallmark Excavating, Inc.
482 Blackbrook Rd.
Painesville, OH 44077
Phone number: (440) 352-3138

5 CIR, Inc.
2856 N. County Line Rd.
Geneva, OH 44041
Phone number: (440) 352-2256
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Baldwin Road Street and Culvert Replacement
Village of Kirtland Hills
Bid Opening Date: May 17, 2012
Bid Tabulation Summary
Base Bid
Project No. 10376

LIST OF TOTALS
NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

Bidder's
Name Calculated Total Informal Totals
1.  Mr. Excavator, Inc. $486,284.02
2. Eclinse Co.,LL.C. $491,641.65 $500.556.24
3. Karvo Paving Co. $497.445.75
4. Hallmark Excavating, Inc. $509,932.45
5. CJIR..Inc. $522,325.83

May 17,2012 Page 1
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Baldwin Road Street and Culvert Replacement
Village of Kirtland Hills
Bid Opening Date: May 17, 2012
Bid Tabulation Summary
Alternate A - Pavement Resurfacing 2012
Project No. 10376

LIST OF BIDDERS
BIDDER

1 Karvo Paving Co.
4524 Hudson Drive

Stow, OH 44224
Phone number: (330) 929-9616

2 Mr. Excavator, Inc.
8616 Euclid Chardon Rd.

Kirtland, OH 44094
Phone number: (440) 256-2008

3 Eclipse Co., L.L.C.
23209 Miles Rd. #120 B
Warrensville Hts., OH 44128
Phone number: (216) 332-9821

4 Hallmark Excavating, Inc.
482 Blackbrook Rd.

Painesville, OH 44077
Phone number: (440) 352-3138
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Baldwin Road Street and Culvert Replacement
Village of Kirtland Hills
Bid Opening Date: May 17, 2012
Bid Tabulation Summary
Alternate A - Pavement Resurfacing 2012
Project No. 10376

LIST OF TOTALS
NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

Bidder's
Name Calculated Total Informal Totals
1.  Xarvo Paving Co. $310,758.00
2.  Mr. Excavator, Inc. $321,150.00
3.  Eclipse Co..L.L.C. $343,040.37
4. Hallmark Excavating, Inc. $356,308.00

May 17,2012 Page 1
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Baldwin Road Street and Culvert Replacement
Village of Kirtland Hills
Bid Opening Date: May 17, 2012
Bid Tabulation Summary
Alternate B - Pavement Resurfacing 2013
Project No. 10376

LIST OF BIDDERS
BIDDER

1 Hallmark Excavating, Inc.
482 Blackbrook Rd.
Painesville, OH 44077
Phone number: (440) 352-3138

2 Mr. Excavator, Inc.
8616 Euclid Chardon Rd.

Kirtland, OH 44094
Phone number: (440) 256-2008

3 Eclipse Co., L.L.C.
23209 Miles Rd. #120 B

Warrensville Hts., OH 44128
Phone number: (216) 332-9821

4 Karvo Paving Co.
4524 Hudson Drive
Stow, OH 44224
Phone number: (330) 929-9616

May 17, 2012 Page 1



Baldwin Road Street and Culvert Replacement
Village of Kirtland Hills
Bid Opening Date: May 17, 2012
Bid Tabulation Summary
Alternate B - Pavement Resurfacing 2013
Project No. 10376

LIST OF TOTALS
NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

Bidder's
Name Calculated Total Informal Totals
1. Mr. Excavator, Inc. $326,596.60
2. Eclipse Co.,L.L.C. $352,513.39
3. Karvo Paving Co. $359,250.75 $360.342.75
4, Hallmark Excavating, Inc. $367,806.00

May 17,2012 Page 1
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