PROJECT: City Hall Park Asphalt Path Improvements

OWNER: City of Mentor-on-the-Lake

PROJECT NO.: 17001102
BIDDER Base Base Bid & Base Bid &
SORTED BY BASE BID Bid Alternate - Alternates -
FALL 2017 COMPLETION Seal Coat Seal Coat &
Existing 1" Addl Asph
Asphalt Pavement
Carron Asphalt Paving, Inc. 37,890.00 38,688.00 57,688.00
Burton Scott Contractors LLC  48,800.00 49,850.00 68,850.00
Chagrin Valley Paving, Inc. 49,910.00 50,960.00 60,460.00
Ronyak Paving, Inc. 54,248.00 55,061.75 84,131.75
ALTERNATES Seal Coat Additional Additional
Existing Path Asphalt Asphalt
& Path in Pavement Pavement
Parking Lot Thickness Thickness
525 SY 1"=19 CY Unit Price
Carron Asphalt Paving, Inc. 798.00 19,000.00 1,000.00
Burton Scott Contractors LLC 1,050.00 19,000.00 1,000.00
Chagrin Valley Paving, Inc. 1,050.00 9,500.00 500.00
Ronyak Paving, Inc. 813.75 29,070.00 1,530.00
BIDDER Base Base Bid & Base Bid &
SORTED BY BASE BID Bid Alternate - Alternates -
SPRING 2018 COMPLETION Seal Coat Seal Coat &
Existing 1" Addl Asph
Asphalt Pavement
Carron Asphalt Paving, Inc. 39,890.00 40,688.00 59,688.00
Burton Scott Contractors LLC  NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chagrin Valley Paving, Inc. 51,160.00 52,210.00 62,185.00
Ronyak Paving, Inc. 56,218.00 57,031.75 87,431.75
ALTERNATES Seal Coat Additional Additional
Existing Path Asphalt Asphalt
& Path in Pavement Pavement
Parking Lot Thickness Thickness
525 SY 1"=19 CY Unit Price
Carron Asphalt Paving, Inc. 798.00 19,000.00 1,000.00
Burton Scott Contractors LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID
Chagrin Valley Paving, Inc. 1,050.00 9,975.00 525.00
Ronyak Paving, Inc. 813.75 30,400.00 1,600.00




City Hall Park Asphalt Path Improvements
City of Mentor on the Lake
Bid Opening Date: September 22, 2017
Bid Tabulation Summary
Base Bid - Fall '17 Completion Date
Project No. 17001102

LIST OF BIDDERS
BIDDER

1 Carron Asphalt Paving, Inc.
7615 Bond St.

Solon, OH 44139
Phone number: (440) 439-6464

2 Burton Scot Contractors LLC
11330 Kinsman Road

Newbury, OH 44065
Phone number: (440) 564-1011

3 Chagrin Valley Paving, Inc.
17290 Munn Rd.

Chagrin Falls, OH 44023
Phone number: (440) 543-2253

4 Ronyak Paving, Inc.
14376 N. Cheshire St.

Burton, OH 44021
Phone number: (440) 834-1988
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City Hall Park Asphalt Path Improvements
City of Mentor on the Lake
Bid Opening Date: September 22, 2017
Bid Tabulation Summary
Base Bid - Fall '17 Completion Date
Project No. 17001102

LIST OF TOTALS
NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

Bidder's

Name Calculated Total Informal Totals
1.  Carron Asphalt Paving, Inc. $37,890.00
2. Burton Scot Contractors LLC $48.800.00
3. Chagrin Valley Paving, Inc. $49.910.00
4.  Ronyak Paving, Inc. $54,248.00
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City Hall Park Asphalt Path Improvements
City of Mentor on the Lake
Bid Opening Date: September 22, 2017
Bid Tabulation Summary
Base Bid - Spring '18 Completion Date
Project No. 17001102

LIST OF TOTALS
NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

Bidder's
Name Calculated Total Informal Totals
1.  Carron Asphalt Paving, Inc. $39.890.00
2.  Chagrin Valley Paving, Inc. $51,160.00
3. Ronyak Paving, Inc. $56,218.00

September 22, 2017 Page 1
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