

**BID TAB**  
Page 1

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND CORRECT COPY OF THE BIDS RECEIVED FOR THE  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE.

PROJECT AT 3:00P.M. ON NOVEMBER 2, 2009.

*Harold G. Huff*  
HAROLD G. HUFF, P.E. DIRECTOR  
PORTAGE COUNTY WATER RESOURCES

*David A. Sloan* 35  
DAVID A. SLOAN  
CONSTRUCTION ENGINEER

11/10/09  
DATE

11-9-09  
DATE

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY		CONTRACTOR/SURETY
				1	2	
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	\$955,287.00/\$477,644.00	\$700,000.00/\$838,000.00	Lakeland Management Systems, Inc 915 Callendar Blvd. Painesville, OH 44077 440-579-1100 Fax: 440-579-1200 Fidelity & Deposit Co. of Maryland 1400 American LN Schaumburg, IL 60196
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$1,432,931.00 \$5,524.00/\$11,049.00 \$16,573.00	\$1,538,000.00 \$10,000.00/\$7,900.00 \$17,900.00	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$760.00/\$1,520.00 \$2,280.00	\$700.00/\$1,500.00 \$2,200.00	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$8,351.00/\$16,701.00 (\$25,052.00)	\$7,000.00/\$16,000.00 (\$23,000.00)	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$18,579.00/\$9,290.00 (\$27,869.00)	\$12,000.00/\$12,000.00 (\$24,000.00)	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$19,023.00/\$9,512.00 (\$28,535.00)	\$17,000.00/\$17,000.00 (\$34,000.00)	
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	\$771,287.00/\$385,644.00 \$1,156,931.00	\$688,000.00/\$600,000.00 \$1,288,000.00	
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$5,524.00/\$11,049.00 \$16,573.00	\$10,000.00/\$7,900.00 \$17,900.00	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$760.00/\$1,520.00 \$2,280.00	\$700.00/\$1,500.00 \$2,200.00	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$8,351.00/\$16,701.00 (\$25,052.00)	\$7,000.00/\$16,000.00 (\$23,000.00)	
2	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$13,427.00/\$6,713.00 (\$20,140.00)	\$8,000.00/\$8,000.00 (\$16,000.00)	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$13,915.00/\$6,958.00 (\$20,873.00)	\$12,000.00/\$12,000.00 (\$24,000.00)	
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
3	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
4	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	

**BID TAB**  
Page 2

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY 3		CONTRACTOR/SURETY 4	
				Labor/Material	BID PRICE	Labor/Material	BID PRICE
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	\$943,600.00/\$629,000.00	\$1,025,338.00/\$552,105.00	Augere Construction Co.	
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$12,025.00/5,200.00	\$1,572,600.00	77 Milford Dr., Suite 212 Hudson, OH 44236 330-342-4287 Fax: 330-342-0807	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$1,500.00/\$1,500.00	\$1,929.00/\$1,038.00	The Hartford Fire Ins.Co	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$1,400.00/\$7,100.00	\$3,000.00	5445 Corporate Drive, Suite 300 Troy, MI 48098	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$2,775.00/\$6,475.00	\$3,575.00/\$1,925.00		
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$2,775.00/\$6,475.00	\$8,500.00		
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	\$5,880.00/\$13,720.00	\$9,250.00		
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$12,025.00/\$5,200.00	\$17,225.00	No Bid	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$1,500.00/\$1,500.00	\$3,000.00	No Bid	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$1,400.00/\$7,100.00	\$7,100.00	No Bid	
2	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$3,060.00/\$2,040.00	\$5,100.00	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$9,180.00/\$6,120.00	\$15,300.00	No Bid	
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
3	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
4	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

\* Math error - incorrect amount of \$1,303,500.00 on bid form.

**BID TAB**

Page 3

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
 OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
 PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY		
				Labor/Material BID PRICE	Labor/Material BID PRICE	
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	\$586,000.00/\$1,000,000.00 \$1,586,000.00	\$642,000.00/\$965,000.00 \$1,607,000.00	
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$7,500.00/\$10,000.00 \$17,500.00	\$9,000.00/\$10,000.00 \$19,000.00	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$1,000.00/\$1,000.00 \$2,000.00	\$1,000.00/\$2,000.00 \$3,000.00	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$5,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$25,000.00)	\$6,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$26,000.00)	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$9,000.00/\$13,000.00 (\$22,000.00)	\$10,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$30,000.00)	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$10,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$30,000.00)	\$10,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$30,000.00)	
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	\$340,000.00/\$1,000,000.00 \$1,340,000.00	\$512,800.00/\$769,200.00 \$1,282,000.00	
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$7,500.00/\$10,000.00 \$17,500.00	\$9,000.00/\$10,000.00 \$19,000.00	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$1,000.00/\$1,000.00 \$2,000.00	\$1,000.00/\$2,000.00 \$3,000.00	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$5,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$25,000.00)	\$6,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$26,000.00)	
2	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$9,000.00/\$13,000.00 (\$22,000.00)	\$10,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$30,000.00)	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$10,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$30,000.00)	\$10,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$30,000.00)	
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	3	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	\$586,000.00/\$1,000,000.00 \$1,586,000.00	\$642,000.00/\$965,000.00 \$1,607,000.00
		A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$7,500.00/\$10,000.00 \$17,500.00	\$9,000.00/\$10,000.00 \$19,000.00
A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League		1	LS	\$1,000.00/\$1,000.00 \$2,000.00	\$1,000.00/\$2,000.00 \$3,000.00	
D1 Pallet Racking		1	LS	\$5,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$25,000.00)	\$6,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$26,000.00)	
D2 Records Room		1	LS	\$9,000.00/\$13,000.00 (\$22,000.00)	\$10,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$30,000.00)	
D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101		1	LS	\$10,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$30,000.00)	\$10,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$30,000.00)	
Electrical, Complete		1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
D2 Records Room		1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101		1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete		1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
4	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	\$586,000.00/\$1,000,000.00 \$1,586,000.00	\$642,000.00/\$965,000.00 \$1,607,000.00	
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$7,500.00/\$10,000.00 \$17,500.00	\$9,000.00/\$10,000.00 \$19,000.00	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$1,000.00/\$1,000.00 \$2,000.00	\$1,000.00/\$2,000.00 \$3,000.00	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$5,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$25,000.00)	\$6,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$26,000.00)	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$9,000.00/\$13,000.00 (\$22,000.00)	\$10,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$30,000.00)	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$10,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$30,000.00)	\$10,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$30,000.00)	
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	

**BID TAB**  
Page 4

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY 7		CONTRACTOR/SURETY 8		
				Labor/Material	BID PRICE	Labor/Material	BID PRICE	
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	\$600,000.00/\$1,021,000.00	\$1,621,000.00	Cleveland Construction	\$658,000.00/\$989,000.00	
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$3,000.00/\$15,000.00	\$18,000.00	8620 Tyler Blvd. Mentor, OH 44060 440-255-8000 Fax: 440-205-1138	\$8,300.00/\$8,300.00 \$16,600.00	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$500.00/\$1,800.00	\$2,300.00	Federal Insurance Company 15 Mountain View Rd Warren, NJ 07059	\$1,000.00/\$1,000.00 \$2,000.00	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$2,270.00/\$22,000.00	(\$24,270.00)		\$4,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$24,000.00)	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$8,000.00/\$15,000.00	(\$23,000.00)		\$12,500.00/\$12,500.00 (\$25,000.00)	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$8,000.00/\$15,000.00	(\$23,000.00)		\$16,250.00/\$16,250.00 (\$32,500.00)	
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	\$500,000.00/\$841,000.00	\$1,341,000.00		\$568,000.00/\$852,000.00 \$1,420,000.00	
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$3,000.00/\$15,000.00	\$18,000.00		\$8,300.00/\$8,300.00 \$16,600.00	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$500.00/\$1,800.00	\$2,300.00		\$1,000.00/\$1,000.00 \$2,000.00	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$2,470.00/\$22,000.00	(\$24,470.00)		\$4,000.00/\$20,000.00 (\$24,000.00)	
2	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$5,000.00/\$10,000.00	(\$15,000.00)		\$9,000.00/\$9,000.00 (\$18,000.00)	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$5,000.00/\$10,000.00	(\$15,000.00)		\$12,000.00/\$12,000.00 (\$24,000.00)	
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid	
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid	
	3	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid
		D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid
D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101		1	LS	No Bid			No Bid	
Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete		1	LS	No Bid			No Bid	
D2 Records Room		1	LS	No Bid			No Bid	
D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101		1	LS	No Bid			No Bid	
4		Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid
		D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid
		D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid
		Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid			No Bid	

**BID TAB**  
Page 5

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY		CONTRACTOR/SURETY
				Labor/Material	BID PRICE	
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	\$800,000.00/\$849,000.00	\$521,107.00/\$1,142,773.00	10 Workman Industrial Services, Inc. 310 Tallmadge Rd. Kent, OH 44240 330-678-7002 Fax: 330-678-7332  Ohio Farmers Insurance One Park Circle Westfield Ctr., OH 44140
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$9,250.00/\$9,250.00	\$10,836.00/\$7,224.00	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$1,250.00/\$1,250.00	\$1,140.00/\$450.00	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$6,500.00/\$6,500.00	\$8,495.00/\$16,989.00	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$14,500.00/\$14,500.00	\$12,125.00/\$15,475.00	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$18,500.00/\$18,500.00	\$6,855.00/\$13,037.00	
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	No Bid	\$487,801.00/\$910,323.00	
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	No Bid	\$10,836.00/\$7,224.00	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	No Bid	\$1,140.00/\$450.00	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	No Bid	\$8,495.00/\$16,989.00	
2	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	\$8,795.00/\$6,375.00	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	\$4,467.00/\$9,237.00	
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
3	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
4	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	\$80,189.00/\$78,435.00	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	\$3,600.00/\$3,200.00	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	\$2,740.00/\$2,540.00	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	(\$5,280.00)	

**BID TAB**  
Page 6

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY		CONTRACTOR/SURETY	
				Labor/Material	BID PRICE		
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	\$680,200.00	\$1,000,000.00	\$693,600.00	
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$7,500.00	\$10,000.00	\$6,000.00	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00	\$1,000.00	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$5,000.00	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$10,000.00	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$10,000.00	
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	\$700,500.00	\$750,000.00	No Bid	
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$7,500.00	\$10,000.00	No Bid	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00	No Bid	
2	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$14,000.00	\$14,000.00	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$18,000.00	\$15,000.00	No Bid	
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid	
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid	
	3	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	\$680,200.00	\$1,000,000.00	\$693,600.00
		A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$7,500.00	\$10,000.00	\$6,000.00
A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League		1	LS	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00	\$1,000.00	
D1 Pallet Racking		1	LS	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$5,000.00	
D2 Records Room		1	LS	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$10,000.00	
D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101		1	LS	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$10,000.00	
Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting		1	LS	\$700,500.00	\$750,000.00	No Bid	
A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden		1	LS	\$7,500.00	\$10,000.00	No Bid	
A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League		1	LS	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00	No Bid	
D1 Pallet Racking		1	LS	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00	No Bid	
4	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$14,000.00	\$14,000.00	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$18,000.00	\$15,000.00	No Bid	
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid	
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid	
	CONTRACTOR/SURETY 11	Bogner Construction Company					
		305 West Mulberry St.					
Wooster, OH 44691							
330-262-6730							
Fax: 330-264-9747							
CONTRACTOR/SURETY 12							
Sterling Professional Group							
5531 Turney Rd.							
Garfield Hts, OH 44125							
216-475-7670							
Fax: 216-475-7675							
CONTRACTOR/SURETY							
Labor/Material							
BID PRICE							

**BID TAB**  
Page 7

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY		CONTRACTOR/SURETY
				13	14	
					Seese/Sveda Construction 643 W. Exchange St. Akron, OH 44302 330-535-7806 Fax: 330-535-1716	Stanley Miller Construction Co. 2250 Howenstine Drive SE E. Sparta, OH 44626 330-484-2229 Fax: 330-484-4510
					Ohio Farmers Insurance Co. One Park Circle Westfield Center, OH 44251	Cincinnati Insurance Company PO Box 1454969 Cincinnati, OH 45250
					Labor/Material*	Labor/Material
					BID PRICE	BID PRICE
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	\$1,695,400.00	\$827,000.00/\$930,000.00	\$1,757,000.00
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$18,000.00	\$7,800.00/\$10,000.00	\$17,800.00
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$2,200.00	\$1,400.00/\$800.00	\$2,200.00
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	(\$9,300.00)	\$3,000.00/\$15,000.00	(\$18,000.00)
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	(\$27,400.00)	\$10,000.00/\$12,800.00	(\$22,800.00)
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	(\$29,000.00)	\$18,000.00/\$14,000.00	(\$32,000.00)
2	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	\$1,438,600.00	\$706,000.00/\$734,000.00	\$1,440,000.00
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$18,000.00	\$7,800.00/\$10,000.00	\$17,800.00
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$2,200.00	\$1,400.00/\$800.00	\$2,200.00
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	(\$9,300.00)	\$3,000.00/\$15,000.00	(\$18,000.00)
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	(\$27,400.00)	\$7,000.00/\$8,000.00	(\$15,000.00)
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	(\$29,000.00)	\$14,000.00/\$10,000.00	(\$24,000.00)
3	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

\* No labor or material pricing provided.

**BID TAB**  
Page 8

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY		CONTRACTOR/SURETY
				15	16	
				J.T.O, Inc. 6011 Heisley Rd. Mentor, OH 44060 440-352-1900 Fax: 440-357-8900		Vendrick Construction 367 Collar Price Rd. Brookfield, OH 44403 330-448-4600 Fax: 330-448-4773
				Merchants Bonding Company (Mutual) 2100 Fleur Dr. Des Moines, IOWA 50321		Fidelity and Deposit Company of Maryland One Easton Oval, Suite 310 Columbus, OH 43219
				Labor/Material BID PRICE		Labor/Material BID PRICE
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	\$700,000.00/\$1,088,000.00 \$1,788,000.00		\$1,100,000.00/\$714,000.00 \$1,814,000.00
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$6,000.00/\$12,000.00 \$18,000.00		\$10,000.00/\$7,000.00 \$17,000.00
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$1,000.00/\$1,500.00 \$2,500.00		\$1,200.00/\$800.00 \$2,000.00
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$2,500.00/\$13,500.00 (\$16,000.00)		\$5,000.00/\$3,400.00 (\$8,400.00)
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$10,000.00/\$12,000.00 (\$22,000.00)		\$12,000.00/\$8,000.00 (\$20,000.00)
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$10,000.00/\$13,000.00 (\$23,000.00)		\$14,000.00/\$10,000.00 (\$24,000.00)
2	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	No Bid		\$900,000.00/\$614,000.00 \$1,514,000.00
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	No Bid		\$10,000.00/\$7,000.00 \$17,000.00
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	No Bid		\$1,200.00/\$800.00 \$2,000.00
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	No Bid		\$5,000.00/\$3,400.00 (\$8,400.00)
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid		\$10,000.00/\$7,000.00 (\$17,000.00)
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid		\$12,000.00/\$8,000.00 (\$20,000.00)
3	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid
4	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid		No Bid



**BID TAB**  
Page 9

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY		CONTRACTOR/SURETY
				Labor/Material*	BID PRICE	
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	\$2,025,000.00	No Bid	18 <b>Emery Electric, Inc.</b> 2080 Case Parkway South Twinsburg, OH 44087 330-963-7811 Fax: 330-963-7822
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$19,950.00	No Bid	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$2,500.00	No Bid	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	(\$18,000.00)	No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	(\$22,675.00)	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	(\$32,500.00)	No Bid	
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	\$1,799,000.00	No Bid	
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$19,950.00	No Bid	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$2,500.00	No Bid	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	(\$18,000.00)	No Bid	
2	D2 Records Room	1	LS	(\$16,400.00)	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	(\$23,500.00)	No Bid	
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	\$43,000.00/\$90,000.00 \$133,000.00	
3	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	\$1,500.00/\$1,600.00 (\$3,100.00)	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	\$1,100.00/\$1,600.00 (\$2,700.00)	
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
4	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	

\* No labor or material pricing provided.

**BID TAB**  
Page 10

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY	
				Labor/Material BID PRICE	Labor/Material BID PRICE
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
2	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	35,825.00/\$111,160.00	\$69,948.00/\$100,002.00
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$146,985.00	\$169,950.00
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$1,150.00/\$1,975.00	\$1,823.00/\$662.00
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	(\$3,125.00)	(\$2,485.00)
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$955.00/\$2,400.00	\$2,348.00/\$2,617.00
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	(\$3,355.00)	(\$4,965.00)
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBO RO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY	
				Labor/Material BID PRICE	Labor/Material BID PRICE
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
2	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	\$71,250.00/\$100,150.00 \$171,400.00	\$73,500.00/\$109,400.00 \$182,900.00
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$860.00/\$1,190.00 (\$2,050.00)	\$1,000.00/\$500.00 (\$1,500.00)
3	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$180.00/\$1,700.00 (\$1,880.00)	\$800.00/\$2,100.00 (\$2,900.00)
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
4	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid

**BID TAB**

Page 12

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY	
				BID PRICE	Labor/Material
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
2	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	\$72,375.00/\$118,905.00	\$102,900.00/\$110,000.00
3	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$1725.00/\$1075.00	\$825.00/\$750.00
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	(\$2,800.00)	(\$1,575.00)
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	\$7950.00/\$13,906.00	\$800.00/\$550.00
4	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid

\* Not registered plan holder - did not purchase plans.

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY		CONTRACTOR/SURETY
				Labor/Material BID PRICE	Labor/Material BID PRICE	
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	26 Harner Plumbing Inc.* 2480 Bartlett Road Mantua, OH 44255
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
2	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	25 Kline & Kavali Mechanical Contractors, LLC 130 S. Depeyster St. Kent, OH 44240 330-673-8212 Fax: 330-678-8149
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
3	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	Ohio Farmers Ins. One Park Circle Westfield, OH 44251
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	
4	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	\$49,500.00/\$74,400.00 \$123,900.00	\$57,325.00/\$76,975.00 \$134,300.00	Ohio Farmers Insurance 4511 Rockside Road Independence, OH 44131
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$1,530.00/\$3,570.00 (\$5,100.00)	\$2,359.00/\$3960.00 (\$6,319.00)	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$1,960.00/\$840.00 (\$2,800.00)	\$2,544.00/\$6,383.00 (\$8,927.00)	

\* Not registered plan holder - did not purchase plans.

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY		CONTRACTOR/SURETY
				BID PRICE	Labor/Material	
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	\$72,800.00/\$72,800.00 \$145,600.00	\$82,750.00/\$82,750.00 \$165,500.00	\$82,750.00/\$82,750.00 \$165,500.00
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$2,850.00/\$2,850.00 (\$5,700.00)	\$2,250.00/\$2,250.00 (\$4,500.00)	\$2,250.00/\$2,250.00 (\$4,500.00)
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$2,750.00/\$2,750.00 (\$5,500.00)	\$2,000.00/\$2,000.00 (\$4,000.00)	\$2,000.00/\$2,000.00 (\$4,000.00)
	D2 Records Room	1	LS			
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS			

\* Not registered plan holder - did not purchase plans.

PORTAGE COUNTY AND STREETSBORO REGIONAL SEWER DISTRICT  
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT GARAGE  
PROJECT NO. PC (07-140), ST-4 (07-141), PC-W (07-142)

November 2, 2009

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE: \$1,888,000.00 CONTRACT 1

NO.	ITEM	QTY	UNIT	CONTRACTOR/SURETY		CONTRACTOR/SURETY
				Labor/Material	BID PRICE	
1	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete	1	LS	\$634,000.00/\$658,000.00		29 Cavanaugh Building Corporation* 1744 Collier Road Akron, OH 44320 330-753-6658
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$9,000.00/\$9,000.00	\$18,000.00	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$1,000.00/\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$10,000.00/\$14,000.00	(\$24,000.00)	
	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$7,000.00/\$7,000.00	(\$14,000.00)	
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$15,000.00/\$20,000.00	(\$35,000.00)	
	Operations and Maintenance Equipment Garage, Complete Except Electrical and Plumbing & Gas Fitting	1	LS	\$787,000.00/\$775,000.00	\$1,562,000.00	
	A1 Pavement Work Portage County Dog Warden	1	LS	\$9,000.00 / \$9,000.00	\$18,000.00	
	A2 Pavement Work Portage County Animal Protective League	1	LS	\$1,000.00/\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00	
	D1 Pallet Racking	1	LS	\$10,000.00/\$14,000.00	(\$24,000.00)	
2	D2 Records Room	1	LS	\$10,000.00 / \$9,000.00	(\$19,000.00)	30
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	\$20,000.00/\$20,000.00	(\$40,000.00)	
	Electrical, Complete	1	LS	No Bid		
3	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid		30
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid		
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid		
4	D2 Records Room	1	LS	No Bid		30
	D3 Remove Bay From Main Bay Area 101	1	LS	No Bid		
	Plumbing and Gas Fitting, Complete	1	LS	No Bid		

\* Contractor has withdrawn bid.