

City of Wickliffe
 Police Station Roof Replacement
 Contract 1 - New EPDM Roof System

BIDDER	BASE BID Area A	BASE & ALT. 1 Areas B & C	BASE & ALT. 2 Areas D & E	BASE & ALT. 1 & 2 Areas B-E
Industrial Energy Systems, Inc	76,000.00	111,000.00	122,000.00	157,000.00
T & F Systems, Inc.	92,000.00	122,000.00	134,000.00	164,000.00
Building Technicians Corp.	81,000.00	117,000.00	131,500.00	167,500.00
Daugherty Construction, Inc.	112,000.00	172,000.00	168,000.00	228,000.00
Professional Roofing Service, Inc.	115,200.00	169,332.00	180,436.00	234,568.00
Industrial First, Inc.	126,800.00	199,200.00	196,400.00	268,800.00

ALTERNATES

	ALT. 1 Areas B & C	ALT. 2 Areas D & E
Industrial Energy Systems, Inc.	35,000.00	46,000.00
T & F Systems, Inc.	30,000.00	42,000.00
Building Technicians Corp.	36,000.00	50,500.00
Daugherty Construction, Inc.	60,000.00	56,000.00
Professional Roofing Service, Inc.	54,132.00	65,236.00
Industrial First, Inc.	72,400.00	69,600.00

City of Wickliffe
 Police Station Roof Replacement
 Contract 2 - New Modified Bituminous Roof System

BIDDER	BASE BID Area A	BASE & ALT. 1 Areas B & C	BASE & ALT. 2 Areas D & E	BASE & ALT. 1 & 2 Areas B-E
T & F Systems, Inc	101,000.00	133,000.00	146,000.00	178,000.00
Daugherty Construction, Inc.	100,000.00	155,000.00	152,000.00	207,000.00
ALTERNATES		ALT. 1 Areas B & C	ALT. 2 Areas D & E	
T & F Systems, Inc.		32,000.00	45,000.00	
Daugherty Construction, Inc.		55,000.00	52,000.00	

City of Wickliffe
Police Station Roof Replacement

Description	Unit	Industrial Energy Systems, Inc.			T & F Systems, Inc.			Building Technicians Corp.			Daugherty Construction, Inc.			Professional Roofing Service, Inc.			Industrial First, Inc.		
		Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total
Contract 1 - New EPDM Roof System																			
Base Bid, Roof Area "A"	LS	37,000.00	39,000.00	76,000.00	92,000.00	0.00	92,000.00	31,500.00	49,500.00	81,000.00	42,000.00	70,000.00	112,000.00	46,080.00	69,120.00	115,200.00	71,850.00	54,950.00	126,800.00
Alternate A-1, Roof Areas "B" & "C"	LS	17,000.00	18,000.00	35,000.00	30,000.00	0.00	30,000.00	13,200.00	22,800.00	36,000.00	20,000.00	40,000.00	60,000.00	21,652.00	32,480.00	54,132.00	38,600.00	33,800.00	72,400.00
Alternate A-2, Roof Areas "D" & "E"	LS	22,000.00	24,000.00	46,000.00	42,000.00	0.00	42,000.00	19,700.00	30,800.00	50,500.00	18,000.00	38,000.00	56,000.00	26,094.00	39,142.00	65,236.00	40,900.00	28,700.00	69,600.00
Contract 2 - New Modified Bituminous Roof System																			
Base Bid Roof Area "A"	LS	No Bid			101,000.00	0.00	101,000.00	No Bid			40,000.00	60,000.00	100,000.00	No Bid			No Bid		
Alt. A-1 Roof Areas "B" & "C"	LS	No Bid			32,000.00	0.00	32,000.00	No Bid			20,000.00	35,000.00	55,000.00	No Bid			No Bid		
Alt. A-2 Roof Areas "D" & "E"	LS	No Bid			45,000.00	0.00	45,000.00	No Bid			18,000.00	34,000.00	52,000.00	No Bid			No Bid		