

**Mills Road Elevated Water Storage Tank**

**OWNER: City of Avon**

**PROJECT NO.: 12384**

**BID OPENING DATE: November 26, 2013**

**BIDDING SUMMARY**

<b>BIDDER</b>		<b>Part A: Off-Site Work and Allowances</b>	<b>Fluted Column Tank Part A &amp; Part B1</b>	<b>Composite Tank Part A &amp; Part B2</b>
1	CB& I Inc.	\$838,700.00	\$8,375,000.00	<b>\$6,921,000.00</b>
2	Caldwell Tanks	\$924,175.00	\$9,510,000.00	\$8,531,000.00
3	Landmark Structures	\$860,000.00	No Bid	\$7,474,000.00

**BID TABULATION**

Project No.: 12384

Mills Road Elevated Water Storage Tank

City of Avon

Bid Opening Date: November 26, 2013

Ref No.	Description	Quan.	Unit	CB& I Inc.			Caldwell Tanks			Landmark Structures		
				Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price
<b>PART A: OFF-SITE WORK AND ALLOWANCES</b>												
1	Construction at PRV #6 Site	1	LS	29,740.00	152,180.00	181,920.00	54,365.00	184,885.00	239,250.00	50,000.00	120,000.00	170,000.00
2	Construction at PRV #9 Site	1	LS	31,825.00	187,315.00	219,140.00	39,150.00	196,025.00	235,175.00	80,000.00	160,000.00	240,000.00
3	Construction at Existing Detroit Road Tank Site	1	LS	24,700.00	58,940.00	83,640.00	20,725.00	75,025.00	95,750.00	40,000.00	56,000.00	96,000.00
4	Contingency / Discretionary Allowance	1	LS	-----	-----	250,000.00	-----	-----	250,000.00	-----	-----	250,000.00
5	Utility Allowance	1	LS	-----	-----	100,000.00	-----	-----	100,000.00	-----	-----	100,000.00
6	Mills Road Site Sign Allowance	1	LS	-----	-----	4,000.00	-----	-----	4,000.00	-----	-----	4,000.00
<b>SUBTOTAL PART A BID</b>						<b>838,700.00</b>			<b>924,175.00</b>			<b>860,000.00</b>

<b>PART B1: MILLS ROAD SITE WITH FLUTED COLUMN TANK</b>												
B1.1	Construction at Mills Road Site	1	LS	5,236,300.00	2,300,000.00	7,536,300.00	2,327,600.00	6,258,225.00	8,585,825.00			No Bid
<b>TOTAL PART A BID AND PART B1 BASE BID</b>						<b>8,375,000.00</b>			<b>9,510,000.00</b>			<b>No Bid</b>
<b>ALTERNATE ITEMS FOR PART B1</b>												
B1.A1	Asphalt pavement and parking (Sheet 15) - Add or Deduct	1	LS			(2,500.00)			(5,000.00)			No Bid
B1.A2	Reservoir HMS (11268)	1	LS	21,000.00	50,000.00	71,000.00	32,950.00	60,450.00	93,400.00			No Bid
B1.A3	Free Chlorine Residual Analyzers (13350)	1	LS	600.00	9,000.00	9,600.00	3,500.00	12,750.00	16,250.00			No Bid
B1.A4	Cathodic Protection System (16641)	1	LS	10,000.00	14,000.00	24,000.00	10,150.00	15,225.00	25,375.00			No Bid

<b>PART B2: MILLS ROAD SITE WITH COMPOSITE TANK</b>												
B2.1	Construction at Mills Road Site	1	LS	4,622,300.00	1,460,000.00	6,082,300.00	1,523,700.00	6,083,125.00	7,606,825.00	2,600,000.00	4,014,000.00	6,614,000.00
<b>TOTAL PART A BID AND PART B2 BASE BID</b>						<b>6,921,000.00</b>			<b>8,531,000.00</b>			<b>7,474,000.00</b>
<b>ALTERNATE ITEMS FOR PART B2</b>												
B2.A1	Asphalt pavement and parking (Sheet 15) - Add or Deduct	1	LS			(2,500.00)			(5,000.00)			(25,000.00)
B2.A2	Reservoir HMS (11268)	1	LS	23,000.00	60,000.00	83,000.00	32,950.00	60,450.00	93,400.00	15,000.00	110,000.00	125,000.00
B2.A3	Free Chlorine Residual Analyzers (13350)	1	LS	600.00	9,000.00	9,600.00	3,500.00	12,750.00	16,250.00	5,000.00	10,000.00	15,000.00
B2.A4	Cathodic Protection System (16641)	1	LS	10,000.00	14,000.00	24,000.00	10,150.00	15,225.00	25,375.00	15,000.00	15,000.00	30,000.00