

Jindra Park Pool Complex - Demolition Contract
City of Wickliffe
Bid Tabulation

BIDDER		BASE BID (Pool Demo)	ALT. BID (Comfort Station & Basket Ball Court)	Additional Equipment Alternates	Total Base & All Alternates
1	K.M.U. Trucking & Excavating	\$29,734.00	\$8,625.00	\$0.00	\$38,359.00
2	Winters & Lewis Excavating	\$30,300.00	\$8,980.00	\$0.00	\$39,280.00
3	Baumann Enterprises	\$31,470.00	No Bid	\$500.00	N.A.
4	B & B Wrecking & Excavating	\$33,700.00	\$38,200.00	\$4,500.00	\$76,400.00
5	Sharbild, Inc.	\$37,990.00	\$7,000.00	\$0.00	\$44,990.00
6	Great Lakes Crushing, LTD	\$40,500.00	\$14,500.00	\$2,900.00	\$57,900.00
7	Mr. Excavator	\$46,000.00	\$13,000.00	\$0.00	\$59,000.00
8	Badger Construction	\$63,000.00	\$13,500.00	\$6,700.00	\$83,200.00

Jindra Park Pool Complex - Demolition Contract
City of Wickliffe
Bid Tabulation

Ref No.	Base Bid Description	Quan.	Unit	K.M.U. Trucking & Excavating			Winters & Lewis Excavating			Baumann Enterprises			B & B Wrecking & Excavating			Sharbild, Inc.			Great Lakes Crushing, LTD			Mr. Excavator			Badger Construction		
				Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Item Total
B-1	Site Demolition - Main Pool, Wading Pool & Bath House not including removal and disposal of equipment listed in E-1 to E-4 below	1	LUMP	26,534.00	1,200.00	27,734.00	25,300.00	3,000.00	28,300.00	14,735.00	14,735.00	29,470.00	11,700.00	20,000.00	31,700.00	19,200.00	16,790.00	35,990.00	7,900.00	30,600.00	38,500.00	35,000.00	9,000.00	44,000.00	49,000.00	12,000.00	61,000.00
B-2	Contingency/Discretionary Allowance	1	LUMP	-----	-----	2,000.00	-----	-----	2,000.00	-----	-----	2,000.00	-----	-----	2,000.00	-----	-----	2,000.00	-----	-----	2,000.00	-----	-----	2,000.00	-----	-----	2,000.00
	Total Base Bid					29,734.00			30,300.00			31,470.00			33,700.00			37,990.00			40,500.00			46,000.00			63,000.00
A-1	Alternate - Demolition of Comfort Station & Basket Ball Court	1	LUMP	8,000.00	625.00	8,625.00	8,980.00	0.00	8,980.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	13,950.00	24,250.00	38,200.00	3,000.00	4,000.00	7,000.00	2,900.00	11,600.00	14,500.00	9,000.00	4,000.00	13,000.00	6,750.00	6,750.00	13,500.00
	Total Base Bid and Comfort Station/Basketball Court Alternate					38,359.00			39,280.00			N.A.			71,900.00			44,990.00			55,000.00			59,000.00			76,500.00
	Additional Equipment Alternates Items have been bid so that if the equipment listed below is not removed by others prior to start of demolition, the Demolition Contractor shall remove and dispose/salvage the listed equipment.																										
E-1	D.E. Stainless Steel Filter Tank	1	LUMP	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	50.00	50.00	100.00	250.00	750.00	1,000.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	500.00	500.00	1,000.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	1,000.00	500.00	1,500.00
E-2	Teledyne Pool Heater	1	LUMP	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	50.00	50.00	100.00	250.00	750.00	1,000.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	400.00	400.00	800.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	1,000.00	500.00	1,500.00
E-4	Chemtrol 350 Chlorine System w/ Chemical Holding Tanks	1	LUMP	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	100.00	100.00	200.00	500.00	1,000.00	1,500.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	300.00	300.00	600.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	1,000.00	500.00	1,500.00
E-4	Pool Pump w/ Electrical Shut Off Control	1	LUMP	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	50.00	50.00	100.00	250.00	750.00	1,000.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	250.00	250.00	500.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	1,400.00	800.00	2,200.00
	Total Additional Equipment Alternates					0.00			0.00			500.00			4,500.00			0.00			2,900.00			0.00			6,700.00
	Total Base Bid, Comfort Station/Basketball Court Alternate, and Additional Equipment Alternates					38,359.00			39,280.00			N.A.			76,400.00			44,990.00			57,900.00			59,000.00			83,200.00