

Bid Tabulation

PROJECT: Tennis Court Reconstruction
 CONTRACT: Contract A - Jindra Park
 Contract B - Orlando Park

OWNER: City of Wickliffe
 BID OPENING DATE: 7/23/2010
 PROJECT NO.: 10163

Company Name	Bid Amount for Contract			
	Jindra Park		Orlando Park	
	Contract A - 1	Contract A - 2	Contract B - 1	Contract B - 2
	Completion Date		Completion Date	
	October 31, 2010	April 30, 2011	October 31, 2010	April 30, 2011
Carron Asphalt Paving	299,867.25	298,867.25	116,688.00	No Bid
Barbicas Construction	324,581.50	333,098.74	125,681.00	130,696.00
Burton Scot Contractors	327,497.00	331,047.00	142,738.00	144,473.00
Chagrin Valley Paving	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
North Coast Paving	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

PROJECT: Tennis Court Reconstruction Contract A - Jindra Park
 COMPLETION DATE: October 31, 2010

Bid Tabulation

Ref No.	Item No.	Description	Quan.	Unit	Carron Asphalt Paving				Barbicas Construction				Burton Scot Contractors				
					Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	
1	201	Clearing and Grubbing, including Scalping and Tree Removal	1	LS	3,500.00	0.00	3,500.00	3,500.00	2,000.00	3,000.00	5,000.00	5,000.00	3,400.00	0.00	3,400.00	3,400.00	
2	203	Excavation	1	LS	30,000.00	0.00	30,000.00	30,000.00	15,000.00	30,000.00	55,000.00	55,000.00	20,000.00	5,000.00	25,000.00	25,000.00	
3	207	Erosion and Sediment Control	1	LS	100.00	150.00	250.00	250.00	1,000.00	2,500.00	3,500.00	3,500.00	1,600.00	1,600.00	3,200.00	3,200.00	
4	304	12" Depth 304 Aggregate Base	1,010	CY	18.00	24.50	42.50	42,925.00	17.00	20.00	37.00	37,370.00	24.00	36.00	60.00	60,600.00	
5	448	4" Depth #448 Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course, Type 2	335	CY	31.50	101.50	133.00	44,555.00	18.00	120.00	138.00	46,230.00	75.00	100.00	175.00	58,625.00	
6	448	2" depth #448 Asphalt Concrete Surface Course, Type 1	175	CY	41.00	116.00	157.00	27,475.00	20.00	128.00	148.00	25,900.00	100.00	125.00	225.00	39,375.00	
7	605	4" Shallow Pipe Subdrainage with Fabric Wrap, APP	750	LF	10.00	7.00	17.00	12,750.00	3.00	3.00	6.00	4,500.00	7.50	7.50	15.00	11,250.00	
8	607	Construction Fencing	1	LS	1,400.00	3,000.00	4,400.00	4,400.00	1,200.00	3,000.00	4,200.00	4,200.00	1,200.00	1,800.00	3,000.00	3,000.00	
9	607	10' Chainlink Fencing, Black	804	LF	12.50	26.00	38.50	30,954.00	17.50	20.00	37.50	30,150.00	12.00	18.00	30.00	24,120.00	
10	659	Lawn Restoration Including Lineal Grading and Topsoil, APP	1	LS	2,500.00	500.00	3,000.00	3,000.00	2,000.00	8,000.00	10,000.00	10,000.00	3,000.00	4,500.00	7,500.00	7,500.00	
11	Spec	Colorcoat Three Tennis Courts, One Basketball Court	3,025	SY	1.45	2.80	4.25	12,856.25	200.00	3.50	5.50	16,637.50	2.00	3.00	5.00	15,125.00	
12	Spec	Linemark Three Tennis Courts, One Basketball Court	4	EA	255.00	100.00	355.00	1,420.00	150.00	150.00	300.00	1,200.00	125.00	175.00	300.00	1,200.00	
13	Spec	Tennis Posts	3	SETS	850.00	502.00	1,352.00	4,056.00	700.00	1,000.00	1,700.00	5,100.00	600.00	752.00	1,352.00	4,056.00	
14	Spec	Tennis Nets	3	EA	20.00	200.00	220.00	660.00	100.00	190.00	290.00	870.00	75.00	145.00	220.00	660.00	
15	Spec	Tennis Net Anchors	3	EA	1.00	20.00	22.00	66.00	4.00	4.00	8.00	24.00	10.00	12.00	22.00	66.00	
16	Spec	Basketball Goal, Backboard, Pole and Net	2	EA	1,500.00	1,000.00	2,500.00	5,000.00	1,200.00	1,500.00	2,700.00	5,400.00	975.00	1,185.00	2,160.00	4,320.00	
17	Spec	Tennis Court Lighting	1	LS	20,000.00	42,000.00	62,000.00	62,000.00	15,000.00	45,000.00	60,000.00	60,000.00	20,000.00	30,000.00	50,000.00	50,000.00	
18	Spec	Miscellaneous Site Restoration	1	LS	3,000.00	1,000.00	4,000.00	4,000.00	1,500.00	2,000.00	3,500.00	3,500.00	2,500.00	3,500.00	6,000.00	6,000.00	
19	Spec	Contingency/Discretionary Allowance	1	LS	-----	-----	-----	10,000.00	-----	-----	-----	10,000.00	-----	-----	-----	10,000.00	
Total Bid Amount								299,867.25					324,581.50				

PROJECT: Tennis Court Reconstruction Contract A - Jindra Park
 COMPLETION DATE: April 30, 2011

Bid Tabulation

Ref No.	Item No.	Description	Quan.	Unit	Carron Asphalt Paving				Barbicas Construction				Burton Scot Contractors				
					Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	
1	201	Clearing and Grubbing, including Scalping and Tree Removal	1	LS	3,500.00	0.00	3,500.00	3,500.00	2,000.00	3,000.00	5,000.00	5,000.00	3,400.00	0.00	3,400.00	3,400.00	
2	203	Excavation	1	LS	29,000.00	0.00	29,000.00	29,000.00	15,000.00	30,000.00	55,000.00	55,000.00	20,000.00	5,000.00	25,000.00	25,000.00	
3	207	Erosion and Sediment Control	1	LS	100.00	150.00	250.00	250.00	1,000.00	2,500.00	3,500.00	3,500.00	1,600.00	1,600.00	3,200.00	3,200.00	
4	304	12" Depth 304 Aggregate Base	1,010	CY	18.00	24.50	42.50	42,925.00	17.00	20.00	37.00	37,370.00	25.00	37.00	62.00	62,620.00	
5	448	4" Depth #448 Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course, Type 2	335	CY	31.50	101.50	133.00	44,555.00	55.00	100.00	155.00	51,925.00	76.00	102.00	178.00	59,630.00	
6	448	2" depth #448 Asphalt Concrete Surface Course, Type 1	175	CY	41.00	116.00	157.00	27,475.00	65.00	100.00	165.00	28,875.00	101.00	127.00	228.00	39,900.00	
7	605	4" Shallow Pipe Subdrainage with Fabric Wrap, APP	750	LF	10.00	7.00	17.00	12,750.00	3.00	3.00	6.00	4,500.00	7.50	7.50	15.00	11,250.00	
8	607	Construction Fencing	1	LS	1,400.00	3,000.00	4,400.00	4,400.00	1,200.00	3,000.00	4,200.00	4,200.00	1,200.00	1,800.00	3,000.00	3,000.00	
9	607	10' Chainlink Fencing, Black	804	LF	12.50	26.00	38.50	30,954.00	17.31	20.00	37.31	29,997.24	12.00	18.00	30.00	24,120.00	
10	659	Lawn Restoration Including Lineal Grading and Topsoil, APP	1	LS	2,500.00	500.00	3,000.00	3,000.00	2,000.00	8,000.00	10,000.00	10,000.00	3,000.00	4,500.00	7,500.00	7,500.00	
11	Spec	Colorcoat Three Tennis Courts, One Basketball Court	3,025	SY	1.45	2.80	4.25	12,856.25	2.00	3.50	5.50	16,637.50	2.00	3.00	5.00	15,125.00	
12	Spec	Linemark Three Tennis Courts, One Basketball Court	4	EA	255.00	100.00	355.00	1,420.00	150.00	150.00	300.00	1,200.00	125.00	175.00	300.00	1,200.00	
13	Spec	Tennis Posts	3	SETS	850.00	502.00	1,352.00	4,056.00	200.00	1,000.00	1,700.00	5,100.00	600.00	752.00	1,352.00	4,056.00	
14	Spec	Tennis Nets	3	EA	20.00	200.00	220.00	660.00	100.00	190.00	290.00	870.00	75.00	145.00	220.00	660.00	
15	Spec	Tennis Net Anchors	3	EA	2.00	20.00	22.00	66.00	4.00	4.00	8.00	24.00	10.00	12.00	22.00	66.00	
16	Spec	Basketball Goal, Backboard, Pole and Net	2	EA	1,500.00	1,000.00	2,500.00	5,000.00	1,000.00	1,700.00	2,700.00	5,400.00	975.00	1,185.00	2,160.00	4,320.00	
17	Spec	Tennis Court Lighting	1	LS	2,000.00	42,000.00	62,000.00	62,000.00	20,000.00	40,000.00	60,000.00	60,000.00	20,000.00	30,000.00	50,000.00	50,000.00	
18	Spec	Miscellaneous Site Restoration	1	LS	3,000.00	1,000.00	4,000.00	4,000.00	1,500.00	2,000.00	3,500.00	3,500.00	2,500.00	3,500.00	6,000.00	6,000.00	
19	Spec	Contingency/Discretionary Allowance	1	LS	-----	-----	-----	10,000.00	-----	-----	-----	10,000.00	-----	-----	-----	10,000.00	
Total Bid Amount								298,867.25					333,098.74				

PROJECT: Tennis Court Reconstruction Contract B - Orlando Park
 COMPLETION DATE: October 31, 2010

Bid Tabulation

Ref No.	Item No.	Description	Quan.	Unit	Carron Asphalt Paving				Barbicas Construction				Burton Scot Contractors				
					Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	
1	202	Removal of Structures and Obstructions	1	LS	4,500.00	0.00	4,500.00	4,500.00	1,000.00	1,650.00	2,650.00	2,650.00	10,000.00	2,500.00	12,500.00	12,500.00	
2	203	Excavation	1	LS	15,000.00	0.00	15,000.00	15,000.00	10,000.00	18,000.00	28,000.00	28,000.00	8,000.00	2,000.00	10,000.00	10,000.00	
3	304	Erosion and Sediment Control	1	LS	100.00	350.00	450.00	450.00	1,000.00	1,300.00	2,300.00	2,300.00	1,000.00	1,500.00	2,500.00	2,500.00	
4	304	12" Depth 304 Aggregate Base	500	CY	20.50	22.00	42.50	21,250.00	10.00	25.00	35.00	17,500.00	22.00	36.00	58.00	29,000.00	
5	448	4" Depth #448 Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course, Type 2	160	CY	39.00	100.00	139.00	22,240.00	20.00	128.00	148.00	23,680.00	80.00	100.00	180.00	28,800.00	
6	448	2" Depth #448 Asphalt Concrete Surface Course, Type 1	85	CY	53.00	115.00	168.00	14,280.00	20.00	138.00	158.00	13,430.00	100.00	140.00	240.00	20,400.00	
7	605	4" Shallow Pipe Subdrainage with Fabric Wrap, APP	550	LF	12.00	5.00	17.00	9,350.00	3.00	3.50	6.50	3,575.00	8.00	8.00	16.00	8,800.00	
8	607	Construction Fencing	1	LS	1,300.00	2,000.00	3,300.00	3,300.00	1,200.00	2,700.00	3,900.00	3,900.00	1,500.00	1,500.00	3,000.00	3,000.00	
9	607	New Chain Link Fence Fabric and Gate, Black	1	LS	5,400.00	4,100.00	9,500.00	9,500.00	4,000.00	5,000.00	9,000.00	9,000.00	3,000.00	4,500.00	7,500.00	7,500.00	
10	659	Lawn Restoration Including Lineal Grading and Topsoil, APP	1	LS	750.00	250.00	1,000.00	1,000.00	2,000.00	3,000.00	5,000.00	5,000.00	1,800.00	2,200.00	4,000.00	4,000.00	
11	Spec	Colorcoat Two Tennis Courts	1,500	SY	1.72	3.00	4.72	7,080.00	2.00	2.70	4.70	7,050.00	2.00	3.00	5.00	7,500.00	
12	Spec	Linemark Two Tennis Courts	2	EA	200.00	75.00	275.00	550.00	100.00	200.00	300.00	600.00	125.00	150.00	275.00	550.00	
13	Spec	Tennis Posts	2	SETS	850.00	502.00	1,352.00	2,704.00	700.00	1,000.00	1,700.00	3,400.00	600.00	752.00	1,352.00	2,704.00	
14	Spec	Tennis Nets	2	EA	20.00	200.00	220.00	440.00	100.00	190.00	290.00	580.00	75.00	145.00	220.00	440.00	
15	Spec	Tennis Net Anchors	2	EA	2.00	20.00	22.00	44.00	4.00	4.00	8.00	16.00	10.00	12.00	22.00	44.00	
16	Spec	Contingency/Discretionary Allowance	1	LS	-----	-----	-----	5,000.00	-----	-----	-----	5,000.00	-----	-----	-----	5,000.00	
Total Bid Amount - Alternate								116,688.00					125,681.00				

PROJECT: Tennis Court Reconstruction Contract B - Orlando Park
 COMPLETION DATE: April 30, 2011

Bid Tabulation

Ref No.	Item No.	Description	Quan.	Unit	Carron Asphalt Paving				Barbicas Construction				Burton Scot Contractors				
					Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	Unit Price Labor	Unit Price Material	Total Unit Price	Item Total	
1	202	Removal of Structures and Obstructions	1	LS	No Bid				1,000.00	1,650.00	2,650.00	2,650.00	10,000.00	2,500.00	12,500.00	12,500.00	
2	203	Excavation	1	LS					10,000.00	18,000.00	28,000.00	28,000.00	8,000.00	2,000.00	10,000.00	10,000.00	
3	304	Erosion and Sediment Control	1	LS					1,000.00	1,300.00	2,300.00	2,300.00	1,000.00	1,500.00	2,500.00	2,500.00	
4	304	12" Depth 304 Aggregate Base	500	CY					10.00	25.00	35.00	17,500.00	22.00	38.00	60.00	30,000.00	
5	448	4" Depth #448 Asphalt Concrete Intermediate Course, Type 2	160	CY					65.00	100.00	165.00	26,400.00	81.00	102.00	183.00	29,280.00	
6	448	2" Depth #448 Asphalt Concrete Surface Course, Type 1	85	CY					85.00	100.00	185.00	15,725.00	101.00	142.00	243.00	20,655.00	
7	605	4" Shallow Pipe Subdrainage with Fabric Wrap, APP	550	LF					3.00	3.50	6.50	3,575.00	8.00	8.00	16.00	8,800.00	
8	607	Construction Fencing	1	LS					1,000.00	2,400.00	3,900.00	3,900.00	1,500.00	1,500.00	3,000.00	3,000.00	
9	607	New Chain Link Fence Fabric and Gate, Black	1	LS					4,000.00	5,000.00	9,000.00	9,000.00	3,000.00	4,500.00	7,500.00	7,500.00	
10	659	Lawn Restoration Including Lineal Grading and Topsoil, APP	1	LS					1,000.00	4,000.00	5,000.00	5,000.00	1,800.00	2,200.00	4,000.00	4,000.00	
11	Spec	Colorcoat Two Tennis Courts	1,500	SY					2.00	2.70	4.70	7,050.00	2.00	3.00	5.00	7,500.00	
12	Spec	Linemark Two Tennis Courts	2	EA					100.00	200.00	300.00	600.00	125.00	150.00	275.00	550.00	
13	Spec	Tennis Posts	2	SETS					700.00	1,000.00	1,700.00	3,400.00	600.00	752.00	1,352.00	2,704.00	
14	Spec	Tennis Nets	2	EA					100.00	190.00	290.00	580.00	75.00	145.00	220.00	440.00	
15	Spec	Tennis Net Anchors	2	EA					4.00	4.00	8.00	16.00	10.00	12.00	22.00	44.00	
16	Spec	Contingency/Discretionary Allowance	1	LS					----	----	----	5,000.00	----	----	----	5,000.00	
Total Bid Amount								No Bid					130,696.00				