

Woodlands Sanitary Sewer – 04388
 City of Willoughby Hills
 Bid Opening Date: 2/2/06

Company Name	City	Work Phone	Contract 1 General	Contract 2 Electrical	Combined - Gen & Electrical
Shavely Excavating Co.	Chagrin Falls	(440) 585-9091	219,720.00	72,500.00	292,220.00
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	Twinsburg	(330) 425-0232	259,898.77	55,000	293,348.77
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	Warrensville Hts.	(216) 663-6006	330,288.00	No bid	407,788.00
Precision Engineering & Contracting	Solon	(440) 349-1204	408,541.12	No bid	492,447.12
DiGloia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	North Royalton	(440) 237-1978	418,808.00	No bid	No Bid
Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	Walton Hills	(440) 786-1000	420,463.00	No bid	No bid
Goulder, A. J., Electric Co.	Concord	(440) 942-4026	No bid	57,500.00	No bid

Woodlands Sanitary Sewer and Pump Station
City of Willoughby Hills
Bid Opening Date: February 02, 2006
Bid Tabulation Summary
Contract 1 - General
Project No. 04388

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1.	Snavelly Excavating Co	\$219,720.00	
2.	DDD Enterprises, Inc - Twinsburg	\$259,898.77	
3.	Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$330,288.00	
4.	Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$408,541.12	
5.	DiGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$418,808.00	
6.	Triad Engineering & Contracting Co	\$420,463.00	

LIST OF ALL ITEMS

NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

	<u>Bidders</u>	<u>Labor</u>	<u>Material</u>	<u>Calculated Unit Price</u>	<u>Bidders Informal Unit Price</u>	<u>Calculated Line Item Total</u>	<u>Bidders Informal Line Item Total</u>
1.	1.00 LUMP OF (SPC) PRECONSTRUCTION VIDEO TAPE DOCUMENTATION, AS PER PLAN						
	Snaveley Excavating Co.	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$1,000.00		\$1,000.00	
	DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$762.00	\$762.00	\$1,524.00		\$1,524.00	
	Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$2,000.00	\$0.00	\$2,000.00		\$2,000.00	
	Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$1,328.25	\$0.00	\$1,328.25		\$1,328.25	
	DtGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$1,950.00	\$50.00	\$1,950.00		\$1,950.00	
	Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$1,300.00	\$200.00	\$1,500.00		\$1,500.00	
2.	1.00 LUMP OF (SPC) BONDS AND INSURANCES, AS PER PLAN						
	Snaveley Excavating Co.	\$5,000.00	\$0.00	\$5,000.00		\$5,000.00	
	DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$5,000.00		\$5,000.00	
	Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$10,000.00	\$0.00	\$10,000.00		\$10,000.00	
	Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$6,670.00	\$0.00	\$6,670.00		\$6,670.00	
	DtGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$2,250.00	\$0.00	\$2,250.00		\$2,250.00	
	Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$0.00	\$6,500.00	\$6,500.00		\$6,500.00	
3.	1.00 LUMP OF (201) CLEARING AND GRUBBING						
	Snaveley Excavating Co.	\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$4,000.00		\$4,000.00	
	DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$1,989.00	\$1,989.00	\$3,978.00		\$3,978.00	
	Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$5,000.00	\$0.00	\$5,000.00		\$5,000.00	
	Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$2,875.00	\$0.00	\$2,875.00		\$2,875.00	
	DtGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$3,150.00	\$0.00	\$3,150.00		\$3,150.00	
	Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$5,200.00	\$300.00	\$5,500.00		\$5,500.00	
4.	1.00 LUMP OF (207) TEMPORARY EROSION CONTROL, AS PER PLAN						
	Snaveley Excavating Co.	\$1,000.00	\$2,600.00	\$3,600.00		\$3,600.00	
	DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00		\$2,000.00	
	Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$4,000.00	\$1,700.00	\$5,700.00		\$5,700.00	
	Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$6,433.10	\$710.70	\$7,143.80		\$7,143.80	
	DtGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$2,000.00	\$3,250.00	\$5,250.00		\$5,250.00	
	Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$7,500.00	\$2,000.00	\$9,500.00		\$9,500.00	

Woodlands Sanitary Sewer and Pump Station
 City of Willoughby Hills
 Bid Opening Date: February 02, 2006
 Bid Tabulation Summary
 Contract 1 - General
 Project No. 04388

LIST OF ALL ITEMS

NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

Bidders	Labor	Material	Calculated Unit Price	Bidder's Informal		Calculated	
				Unit Price	Line Item Total	Line Item Total	Bidder's Informal Line Item Total
5. 725.00 SQ YD OF (253) SANITARY SEWER ACCESS ROAD, AS PER PLAN							
Snaveley Excavating Co.	\$10.00	\$13.00	\$23.00			\$16,675.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$6.72	\$13.00	\$19.72			\$14,297.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$28.00	\$10.00	\$38.00			\$27,550.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$27.95	\$12.97	\$40.92			\$29,667.00	
DiGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$10.00	\$13.50	\$23.50			\$17,037.50	
Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$38.00	\$12.00	\$50.00			\$36,250.00	
6. 121.00 FOOT OF (603) 6 INCH SANITARY SEWER LATERAL, AS PER PLAN							
Snaveley Excavating Co.	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$46.00			\$5,566.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$22.97	\$28.00	\$50.97			\$6,167.37	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$58.00	\$24.00	\$82.00			\$9,922.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$32.66	\$14.03	\$46.69			\$5,649.49	
DiGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$35.00	\$24.00	\$59.00			\$7,139.00	
Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$50.00	\$20.00	\$70.00			\$8,470.00	
7. 530.00 FOOT OF (603) 8 INCH SANITARY SEWER, PVC, AS PER PLAN							
Snaveley Excavating Co.	\$25.00	\$28.00	\$53.00			\$28,090.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$25.98	\$37.00	\$62.98			\$33,379.40	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$70.00	\$33.00	\$103.00			\$54,590.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$36.46	\$28.92	\$65.38			\$34,651.40	
DiGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$80.00	\$32.00	\$112.00			\$59,360.00	
Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$60.00	\$29.00	\$89.00			\$47,170.00	
8. 752.00 FOOT OF (603) 4 INCH CONDUIT BORED-IN-PLACE, AS PER PLAN							
Snaveley Excavating Co.	\$26.00	\$31.00	\$57.00			\$42,864.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$50.00			\$37,600.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$60.00	\$8.00	\$68.00			\$51,136.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$180.21	\$10.93	\$191.14			\$143,737.28	
DiGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$140.00	\$39.00	\$179.00			\$134,608.00	
Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$147.00	\$29.00	\$176.00			\$132,352.00	

LIST OF ALL ITEMS

NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

Bidders	Labor	Material	Calculated Unit Price	Bidder's Informal Unit Price		Calculated Line Item Total		Bidder's Informal Line Item Total	
				Unit Price	Total	Line Item	Total	Line Item	Total
9. 2.00 EACH OF (604) TYPE "A" SANITARY MANHOLE, AS PER PLAN									
Snavey Excavating Co.	\$1,000.00	\$1,600.00	\$2,600.00			\$5,200.00			
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$715.00	\$1,300.00	\$2,015.00			\$4,030.00			
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$1,700.00	\$2,000.00	\$3,700.00			\$7,400.00			
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$1,463.38	\$1,697.63	\$3,161.01			\$6,322.02			
DiGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$1,200.00	\$2,200.00	\$3,400.00			\$6,800.00			
Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$1,800.00	\$1,590.00	\$3,390.00			\$6,780.00			
10. 1.00 EACH OF (604) TYPE "A" SANITARY DROP MANHOLE, AS PER PLAN									
Snavey Excavating Co.	\$2,000.00	\$2,400.00	\$4,400.00			\$4,400.00			
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$1,055.00	\$2,000.00	\$3,055.00			\$3,055.00			
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$2,000.00	\$3,140.00	\$5,140.00			\$5,140.00			
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$2,502.40	\$3,029.68	\$5,532.08			\$5,532.08			
DiGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$2,400.00	\$3,500.00	\$5,900.00			\$5,900.00			
Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$3,200.00	\$2,700.00	\$5,900.00			\$5,900.00			
11. 1.00 LUMP OF (614) MAINTAINING TRAFFIC									
Snavey Excavating Co.	\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$4,000.00			\$4,000.00			
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$500.00			\$500.00			
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$10,000.00	\$0.00	\$10,000.00			\$10,000.00			
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$3,450.00	\$0.00	\$3,450.00			\$3,450.00			
DiGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$2,000.00	\$350.00	\$2,350.00			\$2,350.00			
Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$12,500.00	\$500.00	\$13,000.00			\$13,000.00			
12. 1.00 LUMP OF (624) MOBILIZATION									
Snavey Excavating Co.	\$2,000.00	\$2,500.00	\$4,500.00			\$4,500.00			
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00			\$2,000.00			
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$4,000.00	\$0.00	\$4,000.00			\$4,000.00			
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$16,675.00	\$0.00	\$16,675.00			\$16,675.00			
DiGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$14,700.00	\$0.00	\$14,700.00			\$14,700.00			
Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$10,000.00	\$0.00	\$10,000.00			\$10,000.00			

LIST OF ALL ITEMS

NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

Bidders	Labor	Material	Calculated Unit Price	Bidder's Informal Unit Price	Calculated Line Item Total	Bidder's Informal Line Item Total
13. 1.00 LUMP OF (659) SEEDING AND MULCHING, AS PER PLAN						
Shavely Excavating Co.	\$5,000.00	\$5,500.00	\$10,500.00		\$10,500.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$10,000.00		\$10,000.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$10,000.00	\$3,200.00	\$13,200.00		\$13,200.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$4,600.00	\$2,300.00	\$6,900.00		\$6,900.00	
DiGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$7,000.00	\$5,500.00	\$12,500.00		\$12,500.00	
Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$7,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$12,000.00		\$12,000.00	
14. 1.00 EACH OF (680) PUMP STATION, AS PER PLAN						
Shavely Excavating Co.	\$20,000.00	\$54,000.00	\$74,000.00		\$74,000.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$50,718.00	\$65,000.00	\$115,718.00		\$115,718.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$34,000.00	\$70,000.00	\$104,000.00		\$104,000.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$29,506.70	\$94,469.57	\$123,976.27		\$123,976.27	
DiGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$69,500.00	\$60,000.00	\$129,500.00		\$129,500.00	
Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$40,000.00	\$62,000.00	\$102,000.00		\$102,000.00	
15. 413.00 FOOT OF (680) 4 INCH FORCE MAIN, AS PER PLAN						
Shavely Excavating Co.	\$10.00	\$15.00	\$25.00		\$10,325.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$50.00		\$20,650.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$45.00	\$5.00	\$50.00		\$20,650.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$26.45	\$7.36	\$33.81		\$13,963.53	
DiGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC	\$25.00	\$14.50	\$39.50		\$16,313.50	
Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.	\$43.00	\$14.00	\$57.00		\$23,541.00	

Woodlands Sanitary Sewer and Pump Station
City of Willoughby Hills
Bid Opening Date: February 02, 2006
Bid Tabulation Summary
Contract 1 - General
Project No. 04388

LIST OF BIDDERS

BIDDER

- 1 Snavelly Excavating Co
7139 Pine St , #110
Chagrin Falls, OH 44022
Phone number: (440) 585-9091

- 2 DDD Enterprises, Inc - Twinsburg
1655 E. Highland Rd.
Twinsburg, OH 44087
Phone number: (330) 425-0232

- 3 Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.
17900 Miles Rd.
Warrensville Hts., OH 44128
Phone number: (216) 663-6006

- 4 Precision Engineering & Contracting
32915 Aurora Rd., #340
Solon, OH 44139
Phone number: (440) 349-1204

- 5 DiGioia-Suburban Excavating, LLC
11293 Royalton Rd
North Royalton, OH 44133
Phone number: (440) 237-1978

- 6 Triad Engineering & Contracting Co.
7575 Northfield Rd
Walton Hills, OH 44146
Phone number: (440) 786-1000

Woodlands Sanitary Sewer and Pump Station
City of Willoughby Hills
Bid Opening Date: February 02, 2006
Bid Tabulation Summary
Contract 2 - Electrical
Project No 04388

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1.	A J Goulder Electric Co.	\$57,500 00	

LIST OF ALL ITEMS

NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

<u>Bidders</u>	<u>Labor</u>	<u>Material</u>	<u>Calculated Unit Price</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Unit Price</u>	<u>Calculated Line Item Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Line Item Total</u>
1. 1.00 LUMP OF (SPC) ELECTRICAL CONSTRUCTION A. J. Goulder Electric Co.	\$8,000.00	\$42,000.00	\$50,000.00		\$50,000.00	
2. 1.00 LUMP OF (SPC) UTILITY ALLOWANCE A. J. Goulder Electric Co.	\$7,500.00	\$0.00	\$7,500.00		\$7,500.00	

Woodlands Sanitary Sewer and Pump Station
City of Willoughby Hills
Bid Opening Date: February 02, 2006
Bid Tabulation Summary
Contract 2 - Electrical
Project No. 04388

LIST OF BIDDERS

BIDDER

- 1 A. J. Goulder Electric Co.
7291 Ravenna Rd.
Concord, OH 44077
Phone number: (440) 942-4026

Woodlands Sanitary Sewer and Pump Station
City of Willoughby Hills
Bid Opening Date: February 02, 2006
Bid Tabulation Summary
Combined Contracts 1 & 2: General & Electrical
Project No. 04388

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1.	Snavelly Excavating Co.	\$292,220.00	
2.	DDD Enterprises, Inc - Twinsburg	\$293,348.77	
3.	Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$407,788.00	
4.	Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$492,447.12	

Woodlands Sanitary Sewer and Pump Station
 City of Willoughby Hills
 Bid Opening Date: February 02, 2006
 Bid Tabulation Summary
 Combined Contracts 1 & 2: General & Electrical
 Project No. 04388

LIST OF ALL ITEMS

NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

Bidders	Labor	Material	Calculated Unit Price	Bidder's Informal Unit Price	Calculated Line Item Total	Bidder's Informal Line Item Total
1. 1.00 LUMP OF (SPC) PRECONSTRUCTION VIDEO TAPE DOCUMENTATION, AS PER PLAN						
Shavely Excavating Co.	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$1,000.00		\$1,000.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$762.00	\$762.00	\$1,524.00		\$1,524.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$2,000.00	\$0.00	\$2,000.00		\$2,000.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$1,328.25	\$0.00	\$1,328.25		\$1,328.25	
2. 1.00 LUMP OF (SPC) BONDS AND INSURANCES, AS PER PLAN						
Shavely Excavating Co.	\$5,000.00	\$0.00	\$5,000.00		\$5,000.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$5,000.00		\$5,000.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$12,000.00	\$0.00	\$12,000.00		\$12,000.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$6,670.00	\$0.00	\$6,670.00		\$6,670.00	
3. 1.00 LUMP OF (201) CLEARING AND GRUBBING						
Shavely Excavating Co.	\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$4,000.00		\$4,000.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$1,989.00	\$1,989.00	\$3,978.00		\$3,978.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$5,000.00	\$0.00	\$5,000.00		\$5,000.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$2,875.00	\$0.00	\$2,875.00		\$2,875.00	
4. 1.00 LUMP OF (207) TEMPORARY EROSION CONTROL, AS PER PLAN						
Shavely Excavating Co.	\$1,000.00	\$2,600.00	\$3,600.00		\$3,600.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00		\$2,000.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$4,000.00	\$1,700.00	\$5,700.00		\$5,700.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$6,433.10	\$710.70	\$7,143.80		\$7,143.80	
5. 725.00 SQ YD OF (253) SANITARY SEWER ACCESS ROAD, AS PER PLAN						
Shavely Excavating Co.	\$10.00	\$13.00	\$23.00		\$16,675.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$6.72	\$13.00	\$19.72		\$14,297.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$28.00	\$10.00	\$38.00		\$27,550.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$27.95	\$12.97	\$40.92		\$29,667.00	
6. 121.00 FOOT OF (603) 6 INCH SANITARY SEWER LATERAL, AS PER PLAN						
Shavely Excavating Co.	\$20.00	\$26.00	\$46.00		\$3,566.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$22.97	\$28.00	\$50.97		\$6,167.37	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$58.00	\$24.00	\$82.00		\$9,922.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$32.66	\$14.03	\$46.69		\$5,649.49	

LIST OF ALL ITEMS

NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

Bidders	Labor	Material	Calculated Unit Price	Bidder's Informal Unit Price	Calculated Line Item Total	Bidder's Informal Line Item Total
7. 530.00 FOOT OF (603) 8 INCH SANITARY SEWER, PVC, AS PER PLAN						
Snavely Excavating Co.	\$25.00	\$28.00	\$53.00		\$28,090.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$25.98	\$37.00	\$62.98		\$33,379.40	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$70.00	\$33.00	\$103.00		\$54,590.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$36.46	\$28.92	\$65.38		\$34,651.40	
8. 752.00 FOOT OF (603) 4 INCH CONDUIT BORED-IN-PLACE, AS PER PLAN						
Snavely Excavating Co.	\$26.00	\$31.00	\$57.00		\$42,864.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$50.00		\$37,600.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$60.00	\$8.00	\$68.00		\$51,136.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$180.21	\$10.93	\$191.14		\$143,737.28	
9. 2.00 EACH OF (604) TYPE "A" SANITARY MANHOLE, AS PER PLAN						
Snavely Excavating Co.	\$1,000.00	\$1,600.00	\$2,600.00		\$5,200.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$715.00	\$1,300.00	\$2,015.00		\$4,030.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$1,700.00	\$2,000.00	\$3,700.00		\$7,400.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$1,463.38	\$1,697.63	\$3,161.01		\$6,322.02	
10. 1.00 EACH OF (604) TYPE "A" SANITARY DROP MANHOLE, AS PER PLAN						
Snavely Excavating Co.	\$2,000.00	\$2,400.00	\$4,400.00		\$4,400.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$1,055.00	\$2,000.00	\$3,055.00		\$3,055.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$2,000.00	\$3,140.00	\$5,140.00		\$5,140.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$2,502.40	\$3,029.68	\$5,532.08		\$5,532.08	
11. 1.00 LUMP OF (614) MAINTAINING TRAFFIC						
Snavely Excavating Co.	\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$4,000.00		\$4,000.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$500.00		\$500.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$10,000.00	\$0.00	\$10,000.00		\$10,000.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$3,450.00	\$0.00	\$3,450.00		\$3,450.00	
12. 1.00 LUMP OF (624) MOBILIZATION						
Snavely Excavating Co.	\$2,000.00	\$2,500.00	\$4,500.00		\$4,500.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00		\$2,000.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$4,000.00	\$0.00	\$4,000.00		\$4,000.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$16,675.00	\$0.00	\$16,675.00		\$16,675.00	

Woodlands Sanitary Sewer and Pump Station
 City of Willoughby Hills
 Bid Opening Date: February 02, 2006
 Bid Tabulation Summary
 Combined Contracts 1 & 2: General & Electrical
 Project No. 04388

LIST OF ALL ITEMS

NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

Bidders	Labor	Material	Calculated Unit Price	Bidder's Informal Unit Price	Calculated Line Item Total	Bidder's Informal Line Item Total
13. 1.00 LUMP OF (659) SEEDING AND MULCHING, AS PER PLAN						
Snavely Excavating Co.	\$5,000.00	\$5,500.00	\$10,500.00		\$10,500.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$10,000.00		\$10,000.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$10,000.00	\$3,200.00	\$13,200.00		\$13,200.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$4,600.00	\$2,300.00	\$6,900.00		\$6,900.00	
14. 1.00 EACH OF (680) PUMP STATION, AS PER PLAN						
Snavely Excavating Co.	\$20,000.00	\$54,000.00	\$74,000.00		\$74,000.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$43,718.00	\$60,000.00	\$103,718.00		\$103,718.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$34,000.00	\$70,000.00	\$104,000.00		\$104,000.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$29,506.70	\$94,469.57	\$123,976.27		\$123,976.27	
15. 413.00 FOOT OF (680) 4 INCH FORCE MAIN						
Snavely Excavating Co.	\$10.00	\$15.00	\$25.00		\$10,325.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$25.00	\$25.00	\$50.00		\$20,650.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$45.00	\$5.00	\$50.00		\$20,650.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$26.45	\$7.36	\$33.81		\$13,963.53	
16. 1.00 LUMP OF (SPC) ELECTRICAL CONSTRUCTION						
Snavely Excavating Co.	\$30,000.00	\$35,000.00	\$65,000.00		\$65,000.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$15,950.00	\$22,000.00	\$37,950.00		\$37,950.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$29,000.00	\$39,000.00	\$68,000.00		\$68,000.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$38,203.00	\$38,203.00	\$76,406.00		\$76,406.00	
17. 1.00 LUMP OF (SPC) UTILITY ALLOWANCE						
Snavely Excavating Co.	\$7,500.00	\$0.00	\$7,500.00		\$7,500.00	
DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$7,500.00	\$0.00	\$7,500.00		\$7,500.00	
Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc.	\$7,500.00	\$0.00	\$7,500.00		\$7,500.00	
Precision Engineering & Contracting	\$7,500.00	\$0.00	\$7,500.00		\$7,500.00	

Woodlands Sanitary Sewer and Pump Station
City of Willoughby Hills
Bid Opening Date: February 02, 2006
Bid Tabulation Summary
Combined Contracts 1 & 2: General & Electrical
Project No. 04388

LIST OF BIDDERS

BIDDER

- 1 Snavelly Excavating Co.
7139 Pine St., #110
Chagrin Falls, OH 44022
Phone number: (440) 585-9091

- 2 DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg
1655 E Highland Rd
Twinsburg, OH 44087
Phone number: (330) 425-0232

- 3 Northeast Ohio Trenching Service, Inc
17900 Miles Rd.
Warrensville Hts., OH 44128
Phone number: (216) 663-6006

- 4 Precision Engineering & Contracting
32915 Aurora Rd , #340
Solon, OH 44139
Phone number: (440) 349-1204